
BOD 2023-2024 – 5R
Resolution on Calling of Ceasefire in the Gaza Strip, Demanding CSU Divestments from

Corporations complicit in military action in Gaza, and Reaffirming Exercise of 1st
Amendment Rights on University Campuses

WHEREAS, Associated Students, Incorporated (ASI) of California State University, East Bay
(CSUEB) is the recognized voice of approximately 12,000 students; and

WHEREAS, it is the mission of the ASI Board of Directors to advocate and provide responsible
and effective leadership for a diverse student population to make sound decisions for the
betterment of CSUEB students; and

WHEREAS, increased acts of hate and aggression towards personal beliefs have been
increasingly prevalent on college campuses around the US and the world; and

WHEREAS, Hamas led a series of surprise attacks against Israel from the Gaza Strip killing
1,200 Israelis ; and1

WHEREAS, the United Nations reported more than 30,000 people have been killed in Gaza,
including 14,685 children and 9,670 women as of April 22 ; and2

WHEREAS, the UN rights chief, Volker Turk, estimates roughly 1.2 million Gazans have
forcibly been cornered and calls for immediate ceasefire and releasing hostages taken from Israel
and those held in arbitrary detention ; and3

WHEREAS, the UN General Assembly overwhelmingly votes for an immediate humanitarian
ceasefire on December 12, 2023 ; and4

WHEREAS, Amnesty International reports persistent restrictions by Israeli authorities on the
entry of essential humanitarian goods into the Gaza Strip, despite the International Court of
Justice's orders for immediate measures to safeguard Palestinian civilians; and

4 https://news.un.org/en/story/2023/12/1144717
3 https://news.un.org/en/story/2024/04/1148876#:~:text=Mounting%20toll,to%20be%20under%20the%20rubble.
2 https://news.un.org/en/story/2024/04/1148876#:~:text=Mounting%20toll,to%20be%20under%20the%20rubble.

1https://crsreports.congress.gov/product/pdf/R/R47828#:~:text=On%20October%207%2C%202023%2C%20the,citi
zens%20in%20Israel)%20were%20killed.
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RESOLVED, CSUEB ASI calls for a bilateral humanitarian ceasefire safe return of all hostages
and unjustly detained civilians; and let it be further

RESOLVED, California State University, East Bay recognizes the significant impacts on CSU
student success and learning from the ongoing humanitarian crisis; and lets it be further

RESOLVED, CSUEB ASI urges the CSUEB students, staff, faculty, and community members
to stay educated and informed on past and current events affecting Jewish and Palestinian
communities; and let it be further

RESOLVED, CSUEB ASI calls for CSUEB administration and UPD to provide protection and
guidance to students and faculty, tenured and untenured, who wish to participate in any
humanitarian rights organizing on campus grounds; and let it be further

RESOLVED, CSUEB ASI calls for students and faculty to adhere strictly to CSU policies
against Discrimination, Harassment, Sexual Misconduct, Sexual Exploitation, Dating Violence,
Domestic Violence, Stalking, and Retaliation; and let it be further

RESOLVED, CSUEB ASI supports a non-violent call for targeted divestments from
corporations that show implicit support to human rights violations against the Palestinians; and
let it be further

RESOLVED, ASI continues to support whereas and resolved clauses of Divestment from
Corporations Complicit in the Occupation of Palestine resolution on May 30th, 2018; and let it
be further

RESOLVED, CSUEB ASI is committed to creating a learning environment that not only
educates students about global issues but also equips them with the skills to be proactive,
informed, and compassionate global citizens; and let it be further

RESOLVED, that the ASI encourages the university administration to adopt a public stance and
issue formal statements on significant international human rights issues, thereby positioning
CSUEB as a leader in social advocacy among academic institutions; and letting it be further
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